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Internet Marketing and Management Group, LLC (IMMG) Develops healthNhappiness.com 
Website 
 
 

Internet Marketing and Management Group, LLC (IMMG) has developed a new website, 
www.healthNhappiness.com which markets health and nutritional supplements. 

  
 
Internet Marketing and Management Group, LLC (IMMG) recently completed development 
of healthNhappiness.com, a new comprehensive, interactive website that markets OPC-3 and 
other nutritional supplements that benefit skin, respiratory, cardiopulmonary, and metabolic 
health.  Business owner Sherri Klein worked closely with IMMG, which is based in Coral 
Springs, Florida during the development process.  “Our website www.healthNhappiness.com 
has many different facets to it, including medical testimonies and it was quite a challenge to 
get everything up on one site,” says Klein.  “Wayne Marnell and his IMMG team did an 
incredible job formatting my website and making it user-friendly.”  “They were absolutely 
thorough in every regard and worked as a real partner to help expand my business,” she adds.
 
“We strive to build a website that provides an opportunity for potential and current customers 
to functionally interact with the company, creating a high-value experience, rather than a 
website that’s merely an electronic brochure,” says IMMG founder, Wayne Marnell.   
 
 

Internet Marketing and Management Group (IMMG) builds more than websites, they build 
business. IMMG is a web-centered, integrated marketing and management solution providing 
lasting impressions that are captivating, inspiring, and emotionally powerful.  Internet 
Marketing and Management Group empowers companies with technology, design, ideas, 
professional marketing and management all designed to dominate the competition. Websites, 
SEO, organic search, PPC, marketing campaigns, public relations, managed ROI, web based 



and traditional media, are some of what IMMG offers.   

IMMG serves clients across the USA, specifically in the Broward County cities of Coral 
Springs, Fort Lauderdale, and Parkland, Florida.  IMMG also serves the Palm Beach County 
cities of Boca Raton, Boynton Beach and Wellington, Florida.  Freehold and Monmouth 
County, NJ.   Manhattan and Nassau County  NY.  Boston MA, Stanford and Bridgeport CT, 
St. Louis, MO, South Carolina, North Carolina and Los Angeles California. IMMG 
maintains Team Members throughout the USA to ensure client satisfaction in marketing 
campaigns, managed ROI, websites, SEO, PPC, organic search, web-based and traditional 
media.  The Team Members are located in Washington, Oregon, Texas, New Mexico, Coral 
Springs and Parkland, Florida, Monmouth County New Jersey, Boston MA, South Carolina, 
North Carolina and Los Angeles, California.  IMMG is one of the most complete integrated 
marketing and management providers for websites, SEO, organic search, PPC, marketing 
campaigns, public relations, managed ROI, web-based and traditional media.  
 
Call IMMG at 1-888-WebIMMG (932-4664) for more information about their services and 
to learn how Internet Marketing and Management Group (www.WebIMMG.com) can create 
a program tailored for your company or organization. 
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Email Address Press@WebIMMG.com 
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